
lead its management student readers to missing the 

format is nothing new. Virtual work arrangements 

and global companies for about thirty years and the 
process had clearly bid fair to expand and prosper. 

require a global pandemic to cause the "wholesale 

The scope that Tsedale Neeley has accorded the 

management processes and techniques on how to 

not include an inquiry into the larger dimensions of 
the theme. The fact is that remote work is very much 

should be deemed to come under " labour markets 
" in the third component of " The Great Reset" that 

to that aspect towards the concluding part of this 
review.

Witness the survey by the Gartner group in April 

city areas and even shrinking of gender gaps and of 
environmental pressures. But on the debit side of 

of work life balance. On the part of leaders and 

culture. While fundamental issues of teamwork 
are the dominant concern for both managers and 
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resultant problems can be both complex and vexing.

 Neeley examines the wide gamut of issues involved 
in remote work against this backdrop. Her approach 

The organising principle is the team and the thrust 
of the inquiry is its dynamics in the remote work 

mainstay of successful business strategy. 

individual performance goals and responsibility 

which are the building blocks for the theme of the 
book.

elaborates how important it is for the work of 
distributed virtual teams to have a launch session in 
the video format to put in place a clear group plan 
so as to ensure that every member understands and 
agrees on the ways and means of working together 

commitment to the team. The launch pads are 

and networks. Nor is that all. Periodic relaunches 
according to the author are as important as they are 
the only "structured mechanisms" to give teams the 

As well as the importance of the launch and relaunch 

means is the crucial need of building trust. In 

where members are separated by geography and 

to be correctly understood in order to make it viable. 

which is the minimum threshold of trust required 

such as happens with collocated teams. Trust itself 

clear goals which team members need to understand 

so also is the awareness of how geographic divides 
complicate trust. Knowledge about the personal 

consciously at it. 

issue which managers tend to deal with through 
measures like keeping track of work habits and 

But digital surveillance should be eschewed as it 
patently undermines trust between employers and 
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dynamics is J. Richard Hackman who has laid down 
three criteria for establishing successful outcomes 
for teams universally and in all contexts: delivering 

team cohesion. She argues that these trifectas 
would conclusively explain why monitoring in the 

to empirical evidence in support of the view that 
desire for autonomy at work is seen as a consistent 

their companies. And the employees who perceived 

depression. But the author enters the important 

whether people will thrive remotely or not.

In chapters dealing with use of digital tools in remote 

the book makes some important points having a 

disease with the pursuit of remote work; the way 

presence in fostering interpersonal closeness within 

teams in remote work. As for the global remote 

to their success. is analysed and ways to achieve 

stressing the point that while these challenges can 

domain where remote teams have to operate and 

The book bears the sure imprint of a diligent 
academic whose varied experience as a researcher 

value. Where it does not venture into analysing or 
hypothesising on issues despite their relevance to 
the broader canvas of industry 4.0 of which remote 
work is a part includes the future of work and 
the progressive erosion of the value of labour in 

bearing the brunt of the "rapid and unprecedented 

women might lose their military and economic value" 

Can he be right?
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